
VENDORS LOCATION MATERIAL PRICE/TON

Cliff's Sand & Gravel Arthur Pit 22A 9.20$          

1128 Federal Ave. 23A 9.20$          

Houghton Lake, MI 48629 6A 22.00$        

Ph. 989-422-3463 1"-4" Stone 22.00$        

4"+  Stone 34.50$        

H-1 Blue Stone 32.00$        

Fill Sand

Winter Sand 2NS 3.40$          

Screened Sand

34CSM

Porath Contracting Nestle Rd 22A

2740 S. Loxley Rd. 23A

Houghton Lake, MI 48629 Topsoil $20.00/cyd

Ph. 989-965-4225 6A 15.00$        

1"-3" Stone 15.00$        

2"-4" Stone 16.00$        

Fill Sand 2.00$          

2NS Sand 2.00$          

Team Elmer's 22A

3600 Rennie School Rd 23A

Traverse City, MI 49685 22A Limestone 24.20$        

Ph. 231-642-1015 23A Limestone 23.70$        

FOB HarrisonYard Top Soil $41.00/yard - 3/4 Screened

3"-5" Lime Stone 38.45$        

4"-12" Lime Stone 50.25$        

16+ Heavy Lime Stone 77.00$        

ROSCOMMON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 SEASONAL SUPPLIERS & PRICES

January 26, 2023 7:00 pm BID OPENING

*RCRC BOARD MOTION TO ACCEPT ALL BIDS AND PURCHASE IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE 

ROSCOMMON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION.

AGGREGATES



Bunting Sand & Gravel 22A 9.00$          

3248 Cook Rd. 23A 9.00$          

West Branch, MI 48661 22A Limestone 23.70$        

Ph. 989-345-2373 23A Limestone 23.2

Topsoil (Screened) 14.35$        

6A Stone 16.70$        

1.5"x4" Stone 21.90$        

4"x8" Stone 35.50$        

3-5" Lime Stone 43.00$        

4"-12" Lime Stone 56.50$        

16"+ Lime Stone 66.00$        

Fill Sand 4.40$          

2NS Winter Sand 7.15$          

Clay 3.00$          

Rieth-Riley Construction 9-Mile 22A 8.00$          

PO Box 49 23A 8.00$          

Prudenville, MI 48651

989-366-9640



VENDORS MATERIAL PRICE/CYD

SRM Concrete** P1 6.0 Sack

805 W 13th St S2 6.0 Sack 149.00$      

Cadillac, MI 49601 Flowable Fill 119.00$      

Ph. 231-667-7438 4,000 PSI Crushed Ext 133.00$      

** Full Price List Attached

Elmer's Concrete* P1 6.0 Sack 152.00$      

1415 N. Clare Ave. S2 6.0 Sack 152.00$      

Harrison, MI 48625 Flowable Fill 122.00$      

PH. 989-313-0204 4,000 PSI Crushed Ext 146.00$      

* Small load charge(Under 4 Cyd) applies

CONCRETE



VENDORS Material PRICE/GAL

Michigan Paving & Materials Co. 40,000 gal of HFRS-2 2.11 FOB

1950 Williams St 2.38 Delivered

Alma, MI 48801

Ph. 989-402-5932 40,000 gal of HFRS-2M FOB

Delivered

40,000 gal of AE-90 FOB

Delivered

40,000 gal of AMS 2.11 FOB

3.38 Delivered

Other - CQSEA FOB

Delivered

BIT Mat Products 40,000 gal of HFRS-2 2.45 FOB

401 Tiernan Rd. 2.63 Delivered

Bay City, MI 48706

PH. 989-684-0341 40,000 gal of HFRS-2M FOB

Delivered

40,000 gal of AE-90 2.45 FOB

2.63 Delivered

40,000 gal of AMS FOB

Delivered

EMULSIFIED ASPHALT



VENDORS SIZE/GA MATERIAL PRICE/FT

St. Regis Culvert* 12"/16 GA Galvanized 9.00$          

202 Morrell St 12"/16 GA Poly Coated 15.00$        

Charlotte, MI 48813 12"/16 GA Aluminized 10.00$        

Ph. 517-543-3430 12"/16GA Dbl Wall Plastic

15"/16 GA Galvanized 10.80$        

15"/16 GA Poly Coated 18.00$        

15"/16 GA Aluminized 12.00$        

15"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic

18"/16 GA Galvanized 13.50$        

18"/16 GA Poly Coated 22.50$        

18"/16 GA Aluminized 15.00$        

18"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic

24"/16 GA Galvanized 17.10$        

24"/16 GA Poly Coated 28.50$        

24"/16 GA Aluminized 19.00$        

24"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic No Bid

30"/14 GA Galvanized 27.00$        

30"/14 GA Poly Coated 45.00$        

30"/14 GA Aluminized 30.00$        

30"/14 GA Dbl Wall Plastic

* Prices firm 30 days from Bid date

Cadillac Culvert 12"/16 GA Galvanized 8.35$          

5305 M 115 12"/16 GA Poly Coated 9.99$          

Cadillac, MI 49601 12"/16 GA Aluminized 10.05$        

Ph. 231-775-3761 12"/16GA Dbl Wall Plastic 9.80$          

15"/16 GA Galvanized 10.40$        

15"/16 GA Poly Coated 12.50$        

15"/16 GA Aluminized 11.97$        

15"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic 12.40$        

18"/16 GA Galvanized 12.60$        

18"/16 GA Poly Coated 15.25$        

18"/16 GA Aluminized 14.91$        

18"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic 19.10$        

24"/16 GA Galvanized 17.50$        

24"/16 GA Poly Coated 20.60$        

24"/16 GA Aluminized 19.70$        

24"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic 30.95$        

30"/14 GA Galvanized 26.35$        

30"/14 GA Poly Coated 33.00$        

30"/14 GA Aluminized 32.00$        

30"/14 GA Dbl Wall Plastic

CULVERTS CMP/PLASTIC



VENDORS SIZE/GA MATERIAL PRICE/FT

Jensen Bridge 12"/16 GA Galvanized 9.50$          

400 Stoney Creek Dr. 12"/16 GA Poly Coated 12.81$        

Sandusky, MI 48471 12"/16 GA Aluminized 10.23$        

Ph. 810-648-3000 12"/16GA Dbl Wall Plastic

15"/16 GA Galvanized 11.42$        

15"/16 GA Poly Coated 16.61$        

15"/16 GA Aluminized 12.36$        

15"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic

18"/16 GA Galvanized 14.25$        

18"/16 GA Poly Coated 19.87$        

18"/16 GA Aluminized 14.87$        

18"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic

24"/16 GA Galvanized 19.75$        

24"/16 GA Poly Coated 26.60$        

24"/16 GA Aluminized 20.05$        

24"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic

30"/14 GA Galvanized 28.50$        

30"/14 GA Poly Coated 40.28$        

30"/14 GA Aluminized 32.43$        

30"/14 GA Dbl Wall Plastic

ADS 12"/16 GA Galvanized

5497 Beechwood Rd 12"/16 GA Poly Coated

Rose City, MI 48654 12"/16 GA Aluminized

Ph. 989-390-6923 12"/16GA Dbl Wall Plastic 5.88$          

15"/16 GA Galvanized

15"/16 GA Poly Coated

15"/16 GA Aluminized

15"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic 8.18$          

18"/16 GA Galvanized

18"/16 GA Poly Coated

18"/16 GA Aluminized

18"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic 11.87$        

24"/16 GA Galvanized

24"/16 GA Poly Coated

24"/16 GA Aluminized

24"/16 GA Dbl Wall Plastic 19.26$        

30"/14 GA Galvanized

30"/14 GA Poly Coated

30"/14 GA Aluminized

30"/14 GA Dbl Wall Plastic 27.81$        

CULVERTS CMP/PLASTIC



VENDORS SIZE MATERIAL PRICE

St. Regis Culvert 12" Reinforced

202 Morrell St 12" Non-Reinforced

Charlotte, MI 48813 15" Reinforced

Ph. 517-543-3430 15" Non-Reinforced

18" Reinforced

18" Non-Reinforced

24" Reinforced

24" Non-Reinforced

30" Reinforced

30" Non-Reinforced

24"X2' C. Basin W/ Bottom

36"X2' C. Basin W/ Bottom

48"X2' C. Basin W/ Bottom

Cadillac Culvert 12" Reinforced 15.35$        

5305 M 115 12" Non-Reinforced

Cadillac, MI 49601 15" Reinforced 19.20$        

Ph. 231-775-3761 15" Non-Reinforced

18" Reinforced 26.00$        

18" Non-Reinforced

24" Reinforced 40.25$        

24" Non-Reinforced

30" Reinforced 61.66$        

30" Non-Reinforced

24"X2' C. Basin W/ Bottom 250.00$      

36"X2' C. Basin W/ Bottom 345.00$      

48"X2' C. Basin W/ Bottom 455.00$      

Jensen Bridge 12" Reinforced

400 Stoney Creek Dr. 12" Non-Reinforced

Sandusky, MI 48471 15" Reinforced

Ph. 810-648-3000 15" Non-Reinforced

18" Reinforced

18" Non-Reinforced

24" Reinforced

24" Non-Reinforced

30" Reinforced

30" Non-Reinforced

24"X2' C. Basin W/ Bottom

36"X2' C. Basin W/ Bottom

48"X2' C. Basin W/ Bottom

CONCRETE PIPE/CONCRETE CATCH BASINS



VENDORS MATERIAL PRICE/TON FOB

Pyramid Paving 13A 59.00$        

600 N Jefferson 36A

Bay City, MI 48708 4E Superpave 63.00$        

Ph. 989-343-9733 5E Superpave 71.00$        

LVSP 59.00$        

Bolen Asphalt Paving 13A 62.00$        

875 Airport Rd

East Tawas, MI 48730

Ph. 989-362-5011

Rieth-Riley Construction 13A 68.00$        

PO Box 49 4EML 68.00$        

Prudenville, MI 48651 5EML 68.00$        

Ph. 989-366-9640 LVUT 68.00$        

HOT PATCH



VENDORS MATERIAL PRICE

Ace Saginaw Paving QPR No Bid FOB

2981 Carrolton Rd 135.00$      Delivered

Saginaw, MI 48604

PH. 989-755-8147

Unique Paving Materials UMP 122.00$      FOB

3993 E 93rd St 135.75$      Delivered

Cleveland, OH 44105

Ph. 231-883-3030

COLD PATCH



VENDORS PRICE/SYD

Better Yards Landscaping 0.99$          

2404 W Houghton Lake Dr

Houghton Lake, MI 48629

Ph. 989-366-4669

HYDRO-SEEDING



VENDORS PRICE/HR

Andre Tree Service 160.00$      

PO Box 1626

Houhgton Lake, MI 48629

Ph. 989-387-0685

Top Flite Tree Removal LLC 310.00$      

5480 Joy Rd.

Gladwin, MI 48624

Ph. 989-714-7583

AERIAL TREE WORK



VENDORS Configuration Duration PRICE/HR

Weber Trucking, Inc Truck & Lead End Dump 10 Hr Day

573 Tuscola Rd Truck & Lead End Dump 40 Hr Week

Bay City, MI 48708 Truck & Train End Dump 10 Hr Day

Ph. 989-225-7440 Truck & Train End Dump 40 Hr Week

Truck & Lead V-Bottom 10 Hr Day

Truck & Lead V-Bottom 40 Hr Week

Truck & Train V-Bottom 10 Hr Day

Truck & Train V-Bottom 40 Hr Week

Truck & Flowboy, 5-Axle 10 Hr Day

Truck & Flowboy, 5-Axle 40 Hr Week

Truck & Flowboy, 8-Axle 10 Hr Day

Truck & Flowboy, 8-Axle 40 Hr Week

Porath Contracting Truck & Lead End Dump 10 Hr Day

2740 S. Loxley Rd. Truck & Lead End Dump 40 Hr Week

Houghton Lake, MI 48629 Truck & Train End Dump 10 Hr Day

Ph. 989-965-4225 Truck & Train End Dump 40 Hr Week

Truck & Lead V-Bottom 10 Hr Day

Truck & Lead V-Bottom 40 Hr Week

Truck & Train V-Bottom 10 Hr Day

Truck & Train V-Bottom 40 Hr Week

Truck & Flowboy, 5-Axle 10 Hr Day

Truck & Flowboy, 5-Axle 40 Hr Week

Truck & Flowboy, 8-Axle 10 Hr Day

Truck & Flowboy, 8-Axle 40 Hr Week

VENDORS Configuration Duration PRICE/HR

Wangler & Sons Trucking Truck & Lead End Dump 10 Hr Day 120.00$      

156 E M-55 Truck & Lead End Dump 40 Hr Week 120.00$      

West Branch, MI 48661 Truck & Train End Dump 10 Hr Day 155.00$      

Ph. 989-345-0977 Truck & Train End Dump 40 Hr Week 155.00$      

Truck & Lead V-Bottom 10 Hr Day 125.00$      

Truck & Lead V-Bottom 40 Hr Week 125.00$      

Truck & Train V-Bottom 10 Hr Day 150.00$      

Truck & Train V-Bottom 40 Hr Week 150.00$      

Truck & Flowboy, 5-Axle 10 Hr Day

Truck & Flowboy, 5-Axle 40 Hr Week

Truck & Flowboy, 8-Axle 10 Hr Day 155.00$      

Truck & Flowboy, 8-Axle 40 Hr Week 155.00$      

SEASONAL TRUCKING

SEASONAL TRUCKING



VENDORS Concentration Season PRICE/GAL

D&J Bowen Dust Control 26% Summer

2037 Dobler Rd 26% Winter

Sterling, MI 48659

Ph. 989-654-9467

Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales 38% Summer

2715 S Huron Rd 32% Winter*

Kawkawlin, MI 48631

Ph. 989-684-5860

DUST CONTROL

* Alternate Bid Price for 38% & 32% based on 9,000 Gal shipments, 3 Hrs to apply load, 

thereafter add $0.02/Gal



VENDORS Material PRICE/Ea

Winter Equipment Co. DB High Carbon No Bid

1900 Joseph Lloyd Parkway SB Through Hardened

Willoughby, OH 44094 DB Vallite

Ph. 888-294-9485

St. Regis Culvert DB High Carbon 107.28$      

202 Morrell St SB Through Hardened 137.70$      

Charlotte, MI 48813 SB High Carbon 114.90$      

Ph. 517-543-3430

Height's Machinery DB High Carbon 103.99$      

8434 M-72 East SB Through Hardened 155.52$      

Williamsburg, MI 49690 DB Vallite ---

Ph. 231-267-9300

Truck & Trailer Specialties of Boyne Falls, Inc. DB High Carbon 109.00$      

PO Box 473 SB Through Hardened 160.00$      

Boyne Falls, MI 49713 DB Vallite ---

Ph. 231-549-3500

Michigan CAT DB High Carbon No Bid

3990 US-131 North SB Through Hardened

Kalkaska, MI 49646 DB Vallite

Ph. 616-258-9452

DB High Carbon No Bid

Ted Festerling LLC. SB Through Hardened

7898 Crump Rd DB Vallite

Alanson, MI 49706

Ph. 231-348-8464

Grader Blades



National Highway Maintenance #34515 Crafco RoadSaver 515 ASTM D6690 $0.598/lbs

PO Box 5315 515 Boxless $0.619/lbs

Akron, OH 44334

Ph. 888-922-3630

P & T Products Dura-Fill 1190 $0.575/lbs

472 Industrial Pkwy

Sandusky, OH 44870

Ph. 419-621-1966

Sherwin Industries, Inc. #34515 Crafco RoadSaver 515 ASTM D6690 $0.6371/lbs

2129 West Morgan Ave #34515 Crafco RoadSaver 515T $0.6146/lbs

Milwaukee, WI 53221

Ph. 414-281-6400

CRACK & JOINT SEAL BLOCKS


