ROSCOMMON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2022 SEASONAL SUPPLIERS & PRICES
February 24, 2022 7:00 pm BID OPENING

*RCRC BOARD MOTION TO ACCEPT ALL BIDS AND PURCHASE IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE

ROSCOMMON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 2/24/22

VENDORS

CLIFF’'S SAND & GRAVEL
1128 Federal Ave.
Houghton Lake, MI 48629
Ph. #989-422-3463

PORATH CONTRACTING
2740 S. Loxley Rd.
Houghton Lake, M| 48629
Ph. # 989-965-4225

VENDORS

SRM CONCRETE**
805 W. 13t St.
Cadillac, Ml 49601
Ph. #231-667-7438

ELMER’S CONCRETE*
1415 N. Clare Ave.
Harrison, M| 48625
Ph. # 989-313-0204

AGGREGATES

LOCATIONS
Arthur Pit

Nestle Rd.

22A

23A

6A

3”-6"” Stone

H-1 Blue Stone
Fill Sand

Winter Sand 2NS
Screened Sand
34CSM

22A

23A

Top Soil
6-A

1”-3” Stone
2”-4” Stone
Fill Sand
2NS Sand

CONCRETE

P1 6.0 Sack

S2 6.0 Sack

Flowable Fill

4,000 psi Crushed Ext.

**Eull Price List Attached

P1 6.0 Sack

S2 6.0 Sack

Flowable Fill

4,000 psi Crushed Ext.

*Small Load Charge (Under 4 cyd)

PRICE/TON
$ 8.00
$ 8.00
$19.00
$25.00
$25.00
S 2.20
S 2.40
S 2.00
$26.00

$10.00
$10.00
$20.00/cyd.
$15.00
$15.00
$18.00
$2.50

$2.50

PRICING

$128.00/cyd
$128.00/cyd
$99.00/cyd

$121.00/cyd

$132.00/cyd
$132.00/cyd
$110.00/cyd
$123.00/cyd
$80.00/load



VENDORS

Michigan Paving & Materials Co.

1950 Williams St.
Alma, MI 48801
Ph. # 989-402-5932

Bit Mat Products
401 Tiernan Rd.
Bay City, M1 48706
Ph. # 989-684-0341

EMULSIFIED ASPHALT

40,000 gal of HFRS-2

40,000 gal of HFRS-2M

40,000 gal of AE-90

40,00 gal of AMS

Other — CQSEA

40,000 gal of HFRS-2

40,000 gal of HFRS-2M

40,000 gal of AE-90

40,00 gal of AMS

PRICING
$1.88/gal FOB
$2.10/gal Delivered

No Bid FOB
No Bid Delivered

No Bid FOB
No Bid Delivered

$1.88/gal FOB
$2.10/gal Delivered

$1.50/gal FOB
$1.72/gal Delivered

$2.45/gal FOB
$2.53/gal Delivered

No Bid FOB
No Bid Delivered

$2.45/gal FOB
$2.53/gal Delivered

No Bid FOB
No Bid Delivered



VENDORS

ST. REGIS CULVERT*
202 Morrell St
Charlotte, MI 48813
Ph. # 517-543-3430

*Prices firm 30 days from bid date

CADILLAC CULVERT
5305 M-115
Cadillac, Ml 49601
Ph. #231-775-3761

CULVERTS CMP/PLASTIC

SIZE/GA.
12”/16GA

12”/16GA
12”/16GA
15”/16GA
15”/16GA
15”/16GA
18”/16GA
18”/16GA
18”/16GA
24" /16GA
24" /16GA
24” /16GA
30”/14GA
30”/14GA
30”/14GA
12”/16GA
15”/16GA
18”/16GA
24" /16GA
30”/14GA

12”/16GA
12”/16GA
12”/16GA
15”/16GA
15”/16GA
15”/16GA
18”/16GA
18”/16GA
18”/16GA
24" /16GA
24" /16GA
24" /16GA
30”/14GA
30”/14GA
30”/14GA
12”/16GA
15”/16GA
18”/16GA
24" /16GA
30”/14GA

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED
Double Wall Plastic
Double Wall Plastic
Double Wall Plastic
Double Wall Plastic
Double Wall Plastic

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED
Double Wall Plastic
Double Wall Plastic
Double Wall Plastic
Double Wall Plastic
Double Wall Plastic

PRICE /FT
$10.25
$20.00
$ 15.00
$12.10
$24.00
$18.00
$ 14.60
$30.00
$22.50
$19.57
$ 38.00
$28.50
$31.50
$ 60.00
$ 45.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$10.35
$13.55
$12.90
$12.25
$16.85
$15.20
$14.75
$20.95
$18.30
$20.80
$27.30
$24.30
$31.05
$42.50
$37.55
$7.65

$9.40

$13.65
$23.05
$32.25



VENDORS

JENSEN BRIDGE

400 Stoney Creek Dr.
Sandusky, Ml 48471
PH # 810-648-3000

ETNA SUPPLY*

4901 Clay Avenue SW
Grand Rapids, MI 49548
Ph. #616-514-5223

*Prices expire 2/24/2023

CULVERTS CMP/PLASTIC(CONT.)

SIZE/GA.
12”/16GA

12”/16GA
12”/16GA
15”/16GA
15”/16GA
15”/16GA
18”/16GA
18”/16GA
18”/16GA
24" /16GA
24" /16GA
24” /16GA
30”/14GA
30”/14GA
30”/14GA

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

Double Wall 12”/16GA
Double Wall 15”/16GA
Double Wall 18”/16GA
Double Wall 24”/16GA
Double Wall 30”/14GA

12”/16GA
12”/16GA
12”/16GA
15”/16GA
15”/16GA
15”/16GA
18”/16GA
18”/16GA
18”/16GA
24" /16GA
24" /16GA
24" /16GA
30”/14GA
30”/14GA
30”/14GA

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

POLY COATED
ALUMINIZED

Double Wall 12”/16GA
Double Wall 15”/16GA
Double Wall 18”/16GA
Double Wall 24”/16GA
Double Wall 30”/14GA

PRICE /FT
$10.30
$14.48
$12.19
$12.20
$17.45
$15.20
$14.70
$21.46
$18.30
$19.50
$27.85
$24.29
$30.73
$42.44
$38.01
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$7.69

$9.42

$13.67
$23.07
$34.18



VENDORS
ETNA SUPPLY
Ph. # 616-514-5223

ST. REGIS CULVERT
Ph. #517-543-3430

JENSEN BRIDGE
Ph. # 810-648-3000

CONCRETE PIPE/CONCRETE CATCH BASINS

LOCATIONS

Grand Rapids

Charlotte

Sandusky

SIZE

12” Reinforced

12” Non-Reinforced

15” Reinforced

15” Non-Reinforced

18” Reinforced

18” Non-Reinforced

24" Reinforced

24” Non-Reinforced

30” Reinforced

30” Non-Reinforced
24”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom
36”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom
48"x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom

12” Reinforced

12” Non-Reinforced

15” Reinforced

15” Non-Reinforced

18” Reinforced

18” Non-Reinforced

24” Reinforced

24” Non-Reinforced

30” Reinforced

30” Non-Reinforced
24”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom
36”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom
48”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom

12” Reinforced

12” Non-Reinforced

15” Reinforced

15” Non-Reinforced

18” Reinforced

18” Non-Reinforced

24” Reinforced

24” Non-Reinforced

30” Reinforced

30” Non-Reinforced
24”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom
36”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom
48”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom

PRICING
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid



CONCRETE PIPE/CONCRETE CATCH BASINS(CONT.)

VENDORS LOCATIONS
CADILLAC CULVERT Cadillac

PH #231-775-3761

VENDORS
PYRAMID PAVING
600 N. Jefferson
Bay City, MI 48708
PH# 989-343-9733

BOLEN ASPHALT PAVING
875 Airport Rd.

East Tawas, M| 48730
Ph. # 989-362-5011

VENDORS

UNIQUE PAVING MATERIALS
3993 E. 93 St.

Cleveland, OH 44105

Ph. # 231-883-3030

ACE SAGINAW PAVING
2981 Carrolton Rd.
Saginaw, M| 48604
Ph. # 989-755-8147

SIZE PRICING
12” Reinforced $18.80/Ft
12” Non-Reinforced No Bid

15” Reinforced $23.55/Ft
15” Non-reinforced No Bid

18” Reinforced $31.90/Ft
18” Non-Reinforced No Bid

24” Reinforced $49.35/Ft
24” Non-Reinforced No Bid

30” Reinforced No Bid

30” Non-Reinforced No Bid
24”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom $271.25/Ea
36”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom $373.75/Ea
48”x2’ C.Basin w/ Bottom S442.75/Ea

HOT PATCH

13A
36-A

PRICE/TON FOB
$57.00 TN

$58.25TN

4 E Superpave $61.50 TN
5 E Superpave $69.00 TN

ANY HMA $60.00 TN

COLD PATCH

UMP

QPR

PRICE/TON
$92.00 FOB

$103.85 Delivered

$90.00 FOB
$ 102.00 Delivered



VENDORS
Better Yards Landscaping

2404 W. Houghton Lake Dr.

Houghton Lake, M| 48629
Ph. # 989-366-4669

VENDORS

ANDRE TREE SERVICE

PO Box 1626

Houghton Lake, MI 48629
Ph. # 989-387-0685

VENDORS

WEBERS TRUCKING, INC.
573 Tuscola Rd.

Bay City, MI 48708
989-225-7440

PORATH CONTRACTING
2740 S. Loxley Rd.
Houghton Lake, MI 48629
989-965-4225

HYDRO-SEEDING

AERIAL TREE WORK

SEASONAL TRUCKING

Truck & Lead End Dump/10 hr Day
Truck & Lead End Dump/40 hr Week
Truck & Train End Dump/10 hr Day
Truck & Train End Dump/40 hr Week
Truck & Lead V-Bottom/10 hr Day
Truck & Lead V-Bottom/40 hr Week
Truck & Train V-Bottom/10 hr Day
Truck & Train V-Bottom/40 hr Week
Truck & Flow Boy, 5-Axle/10 hr Day
Truck & Flow Boy, 5-Axle/40 hr Week
Truck & Flow Boy, 8-Axle/10 hr Day
Truck & Flow Boy, 8-Axle/40 hr Week

Truck & Lead End Dump/10 hr Day
Truck & Lead End Dump/40 hr Week
Truck & Train End Dump/10 hr Day
Truck & Train End Dump/40 hr Week
Truck & Lead V-Bottom/10 hr Day
Truck & Lead V-Bottom/40 hr Week
Truck & Train V-Bottom/10 hr Day
Truck & Train V-Bottom/40 hr Week
Truck & Flow Boy, 5-Axle/10 hr Day
Truck & Flow Boy, 5-Axle/40 hr Week
Truck & Flow Boy, 8-Axle/10 hr Day
Truck & Flow Boy, 8-Axle/40 hr Week

PRICING
$0.90/syd

PRICING
$145.00/hr

PRICING
$145/hr
$145/hr
$158/hr
S158/hr
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$158/hr
$158/hr

$115/hr
$110/hr
$135/hr
$130/hr
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid



VENDORS

WANGLER & SONS TRUCKING
156 E. M-55

West Branch, M| 48661
989-345-0977

VENDORS

MICHIGAN CHLORIDE SALES
302 W. Jackson Rd.

St. Louis, M| 48880

Ph. # 800-286-7312

D&J BOWEN DUST CONTROL
2037 Dobler Rd.

Sterling, MI 48659

PH 989-654-9467

LIQUID CALIUM CHLORIDE SALES
2715 S. Huron Rd.

Kawkawlin, Ml 48631

Ph. # 989-684-586

SEASONAL TRUCKING (CONT.)

Truck & Lead End Dump/10 hr Day
Truck & Lead End Dump/40 hr Week
Truck & Train End Dump/10 hr Day
Truck & Train End Dump/40 hr Week
Truck & Lead V-Bottom/10 hr Day
Truck & Lead V-Bottom/40 hr Week
Truck & Train V-Bottom/10 hr Day
Truck & Train V-Bottom/40 hr Week
Truck & Flow Boy, 5-Axle/10 hr Day
Truck & Flow Boy, 5-Axle/40 hr Week
Truck & Flow Boy, 8-Axle/10 hr Day
Truck & Flow Boy, 8-Axle/40 hr Week

DUST CONTROL

(26%)

RCRC WINTER (26%)

(38%)*

RCRC WINTER(32%)*

PRICING
$120/hr
$115/hr
$150/hr
$145/hr
$120/hr
$115/hr
$150/hr
$145/hr
No Bid

No Bid

$150/hr
$145/hr

PRICING
NO BID

$0.27/gallon
$0.22/gallon

$0.671/gallon
$0.54/gallon

*ALTERNATE BID PRICE FOR 38% & 32%

BASED ON 9,000 GALLON SHIPMENTS, 3 HRS TO

APPLY LOAD, THEREAFTER ADD $0.02/GALLON



