ROSCOMMON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2021 SEASONAL SUPPLIERS & PRICES
February 25, 2021 7:00 pm BID OPENING

*STAFF’'S RECOMMENDATION IS TO ACCEPT ALL SEASONAL BIDS AND PURCHASE IN THE BEST

INTEREST OF THE ROSCOMMON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION.

AGGREGATES

VENDORS LOCATIONS
CLIFF’'S SAND & GRAVEL AUTHUR PIT
PH # 422-3463

Team Elmer’s

Ph # 1-231-943-3443

Scott’s Excavating Roscommon
Ph # 275-5011

Porath Contracting Nestle Rd.

Ph. # 989-965-4225

22A $6.90

23A $7.00

6A $17.00
22-A Limestone $16.00
H-1 BLUE STONE $21.00
FILL SAND $1.90
Winter Sand 2NS $1.95
34CSM $20.00
Oversize $20.00
22-A Limestone $20.20 Del.
23-A Limestone $19.55 Del.
3 to5 limestone $31.50 Del.
4 to 12 Limestone $52.75 Del.

PRICING PER/TN

16+ Heavy Limestone  $62.20 Del.

Topsoil $17.50 yd we load
$20.00 yd he loads

Fill Sand $3.00 yd we load
$4.50 yd he loads

Clay $3.00 yd we load

$4.50 yd he loads

23A $8.00
Top Soil $14.00cyd.
6-A $12.50

2”-4” Stone $16.00
4”-8” Stone $18.00
Fill Sand $2.25 cyd.
2NS Sand $2.75 cyd.



ROSCOMMON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2021 SEASONAL SUPPLIERS & PRICES

VENDORS
Bunting Sand & Gravel
Ph # 989-345-2373

Fisher Transportation Company
Ph #989-773-1376

VENDORS
SRM CONCRETE
Ph. # 231-667-7438

TEAM ELMERS
Ph. # 989-313-0204

February 25, 2021 7:00 BID OPENING

AGGREGATES

LOCATIONS

West Branch

PRICING PER/TN

22-A
23-A
22-A Limestone back haul
22-A Limestone
23-A Limestone back haul
23-A Limestone
Top Soil
6A
2”-4” Stone
4”-8” Stone
Fill Sand
2NS Sand
Clay
Delivery Charge

$7.20
$7.20
$14.25 Del.
$17.85 Del.
$14.25 Del.
$17.85 Del.
$11.50
$13.15
$17.55
$28.40
$3.45
$5.65
$2.55
$4.85 per ton

$24.26 Del.
$24.12 Del.
$29.76 Del.
$28.26 Del.

PRICING PER/YARD

Mt. Pleasant 22-A Limestone
23-A Limestone
3”-5” Limestone
H-1 Blue
CONCRETE
LOCATIONS
P1 6Sack
S2 6 Sack

4,000 psi Crushed Ext.

P1 6Sack
S2 6 Sack
4,000 psi Crushed Ext.

$129.00 per cyd
$132.00 per cyd
$119.00 per cyd

$124.00 per cyd
$124.00 per cyd
$121.00 per cyd



VENDORS

PYRAMID PAVING
PH# 989-343-9733

ROSCOMMON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2021 SEASONAL SUPPLIERS & PRICES
February 25, 2021 7:00 BID OPENING

BOLEN ASPHALT PAVING

RIETH-RILEY

VENDORS
CADILLAC CULVERT
PH # 231-775-3761

ST. REGIS CULVERT
PH # 800-527-4604

JENSEN BRIDGE
PH # 810-648-3000

LOCATIONS

HOT MIX
LOCATION PRICING PER/TON DELIVERED
WEST BRANCH PLANT 13A $48.00 TN
36-A $51.00 TN
4 E Superpave $51.00 TN
5 E Superpave $51.00 TN
Ultra Thin $58.00 TN
WEST BRANCH HMA $58.00 TN
9 MILE 13A $56.00 TN

LTBC Tack $3.00 GAL

CULVERTS CMP

SIZE/GA.

CADILLAC

CHARLOTTE

SANDUSKY

12”7 16GA.
15”7 16GA.
18” 16GA.
24” 16GA.
30” 14GA.

12”7 16GA.
15”7 16GA.
18” 16GA.
24” 16GA.
30” 14GA.

12” 16GA.
15” 16GA.
18” 16GA.
24” 16GA.
30” 14GA.

PRICING PER/FT

$7.90 COATED SNOBID Aluminized $9.95

$9.80 “ $11.95
$11.75 “ $13.28
$16.25 “ $17.40
$25.95 “ $28.95

$8.00 COATED S 13.20 Aluminized $9.80

$9.60 “ “$15.85 “ $11.80
$1230 “ “$19.80 “ “ $14.70
$16.15 “ “$25.65“ “ $18.67
$27.00 “ “$32.40“ “ $34.50

$8.20 Coated $ NO BID Aluminized SNO BID
$10.28
$12.48
$17.96
$27.00



VENDORS

CADILLAC CULVERT

VENDORS
CADILLAC CULVERT
PH #231-775-3761

VENDORS
T & W Landscaping
PH # 989-366-0718

ROSCOMMON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2021 SEASONAL SUPPLIERS & PRICES
February 25, 2021 7:00 pm BID OPENING

PLASTIC CULVERTS CMP
LOCATIONS SIZE/GA. PRICING PER/FT
CADILLAC 6” perf w/sock 100’ NO BID
12” x20’ NO BID
15” x20’ NO BID
18" x20’ NO BID
24" x20’ NO BID
30” x20’ NO BID
CONCRETE SUMPS
LOCATIONS SIZE PRICING PER
CADILLAC 24"X2’ $263.00
2” ADJUSTING RINGS $28.00
3” ADJUSTING RINGS $42.00
4” ADJUSTING RINGS $56.00

Better Yards Landscaping

Ph # 989-366-4669

VENDORS

SHERWIN INDUSTRIES, INC.

PH#414-281-6400

P & T PRODUCTS
PH#231-883-3030

HYDRO-SEEDING

CRACK&: JOINT SEALANT BLOCKS

#34515T

#34515 CRAFCO ROADSAVER 515 ASTM D6690

#DURA-FILL 1190 NR

#34515 CRAFCO ROADSAVER 515 ASTM D6690

PRICING
$0.72 PER SQ/YD

$.072 PER SQ/YD

PRICING
$0.4650 LBS
CERTIFIED

$0.4600 LBS

NO BID

$0.4750 LBS



VENDORS
ANDRE TREE SERVICE
PH #989-387-0685

VENDORS
RIETH-RILEY

UNIQUE PAVING MATERIALS
PH # 231-883-3030

ACE SAGINAW PAVING
Ph # 989-755-8147

ROSCOMMON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2021 SEASONAL SUPPLIERS & PRICES
February 25, 2021 7:00 pm BID OPENING

AERIAL TREE WORK
PRICING
$145.00 per/hr
COLD PATCH
LOCATION PRICING PER/TON DELIVERED
9-MILE CP-7 NO BID
SAGINAW UMP $100.85TN
SAGINAW QPR $95.00 TN



